
London Fire Brigade Headquarters
169 Union Street  London  SE1 0LL

T 020 8555 1200
london-fire.gov.uk

Freedom of Information request: Reference number FOI2026/00414

Date of request: 9th April 2026

Request:

Please could you provide the following information for the most recent 12-month 
period available:
  1.  The total number of Parking Charge Notices (PCNs) or parking fines issued 
to operational vehicles.
  2.  Where possible, a breakdown of:
     *   Private parking charge notices (issued by private parking operators)
     *   Council-issued parking fines (Penalty Charge Notices)
  3.  The number of these PCNs that were:
     *   Cancelled
     *   Successfully appealed
     *   Paid
  4.  If available, an estimate of the administrative cost or staff time associated 
with handling these PCNs.

Response:

Please see below for a response to your request:

  1.  The total number of Parking Charge Notices (PCNs) or parking fines issued 
to operational vehicles.

Over the most recent 12-month period (between 1st April 2025 and 31st March 
2026), there were a total number of 823 parking charge notices (PCNs) issued 
to operational vehicles.

2.  Where possible, a breakdown of:
     *   Private parking charge notices (issued by private parking operators)
     *   Council-issued parking fines (Penalty Charge Notices)

Of the total amount of PCNs, 295 were from private parking charging notices 
and 528 were from Council issued fines.

  3.  The number of these PCNs that were:
     *   Cancelled
     *   Successfully appealed
     *   Paid

The number of PCNs that were cancelled is 1,794, 78 fines were successfully 
appealed. 154 fines were successfully paid. We do not hold data on PCNs that 
were successfully appealed.



 

4.  If available, an estimate of the administrative cost or staff time associated 
with handling these PCNs.

We do not hold information as to the administrative cost or staff time associated 
with handling PCNs.

We have dealt with your request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
For more information about this process please see the guidance we publish 
about making a request on our website: https://www.london-fire.gov.uk/about-
us/transparency/request-information-from-us/
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